
Lt. Gen. Joseph H. Moore and South Vietnam 
Prime Minister Nguyen Cao Ky discuss the air 
war. As the initial Seventh Air Force Com­
mander, General Moore approved the 1965 
expansion of Project CHECO activities in 
Southeast Asia. 
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Undersecretary of the Air Force Townsend W. 
Hoopes examines an AC-130 Gunship Ill 
during a September 1968 visit to Southeast 
Asia. Undersecretary Hoopes chaired the 
Blue Ribbon committee which reorganized 
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A MONG Air Force scholars, the 
terms CHECO and CORONA 

HARVEST are synonymous with the 
institutional documentation and 
analysis of combat air operations in 
Southeast Asia. The birth and evolu­
tion of these two introspective pro­
jects were inspired by the unique air­
power role in the controversial con­
flict, which escalated in the mid-1960s 
from a low-intensity counter­
insurgency undertaking into full­
scale, protracted conventional 
warfare. 

Both projects fathered a literary 
cornucopia of Air Force combat expe­
rience and preserved a veritable treas­
ure of documents to further the work 
of present and future historians. Both 
shared the dream of making a truly 
worthwhile contribution to the fur­
therance of Air Force history and doc­
trine. Both, too, shared the frus­
trations that came from examining 
evidence which was oftentimes in­
conclusively one-dimensional, made 
so by the irresolute political conduct 
of the war. Mirrored therein were the 
far greater frustrations our nation's 
military leaders faced in having to 
wage a costly, graduated air cam­
paign, hamstrung by political con­
straints such as highly restrictive 
rules of engagement, the compromise 
of proven air warfare principles, the 
absence of well-articulated objectives 
or a grand strategy for winning the 
war, and the divided home front.' 

Veterans of these two projects 
labored, ever mindful that their exten­
sive documentation and study, along 
with unit histories, might well be all 
that was left of more than a decade of 
air warfare for historians to ponder. 

Project CHECO was the pilot en­
deavor. It evolved from a request 
made in March 1962 by the Vice 
CoJl\mander-in-Chief, Pacific Air 
Forces, for a completely documented 
history of USAF operations in the 
burgeoning counterinsurgency war. A 
brainchild of the USAF Historical 
Program, the CHECO acronym stood 
for Current Historical Evaluation of 
Counterinsurgency Operations when 
its birth was announced on 30 June 
1962.' The subsequent growth of the 
Air Force presence in Southeast Asia 
and of the mission of the special his­
torical project itself are reflected in 
revisions that were made to this title 
over the next several years. Because 
the word "Contemporary" was 
thought to better convey the dual qual-
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ities of "Polaroid" development and 
historical longevity inherent in Pro­
ject CHECO, it replaced "Current" in 
the title in 1964. This change was codi­
fied in May 1965 when the Air Staff 
belatedly issued terms of reference for 
CHECO's activities. Revised terms 
published in April 1966 made another 
change, inserting "Combat" in place 
of "Counterinsurgency" to reflect the 
higher level of air operations in the 
war zone. 

In early 1%8, after the North Kore­
ans seized the USS Pueblo and its 
crew, the Air Staff saw a need for 
specialized historical coverage of 
contingencies other than the conflict 
in Southeast Asia. This was reflected 
in a final change of the title to Con­
temporary Historical Examination of 
Current Operations. The new title also 
made allowances for the interpre­
tative or analytical qualities of 
CHECO studies as opposed to evalu­
ation per se, and the continuing need 

CHECO - Contempor­
ary Historical Examina­
tion of Current Opera­
tions. 

for the project's services following the 
cessation of hostilities. 3 

Organizational alignment and man­
ning for Project CHECO were affected 
similarly by changing events. As an 
offspring of the USAF History Pro­
gram, the infant project was born into 
a disjunctive family arrangement 
which had been several years in the 
making. Unlike most Air Force func­
tions, guidance for the worldwide His­
tory program came from the USAF 
Historical Division at Maxwell AFB, 
Alabama, rather than from the Air 
Staff level. The division maintained 
an office in Washington, but this was 
primarily for liaison with the Air Staff 
and other agencies. This inverted ar­
rangement had existed since 1949, 
when the USAF Historical Division 
moved its extensive document hold­
ings from the Washington area to be­
come part of the newly formed Air 
University. 

There was precedent for believing 
that the existing management struc­
ture was suitable for overseeing the 
special historical requirements of 
Southeast Asia. It had worked well 
enough during the Korean conflict. 

Combat units in Korea had produced 
excellent accounts of their operations. 
and Dr. Robert F. Futrell, the divi­
sion's senior historian, had relied on 
these and other documents when re­
searching and writing his official one­
volume history of the Air Force's war­
time experience.• Under the existing 
arrangement, the program also had 
developed effective worldwide unit 
historical reporting procedures and a 
useful monographic study series pre­
pared by historians at the Air Univer­
sity, the Washington office, and some 
major commands. The monograph ser­
ies seemed to be a suitable prototype 
for Project CHECO to follow, but 
there were other factors that began to 
make established reporting pro­
cedures appear more problematic than 
practical. 

The elemental source of difficulty 
was the anatomy of the project itself. 
Although CHECO was established as 
an arm of the traditional History pro­
gram, its charter was to be "readily 
responsive" to Air Staff needs for 
timely analytical studies. This meant 
that CHECO historians were subject 
to specific Air Staff guidance, which 
would be channeled from Washington 
(via the liaison office) through the his­
torical division at the Air University. 
This seemed simple enough but was 
compounded by an aberrant. organ­
izational arrangement that existed for 
administering historical activities in 
the major commands. Partly the result 
of fiscal austerity, the responsibility 
for organizational histories in the Air 
Force had fallen to the Information 
function in the years following the 
Korean War. This added another re­
porting channel, as Information offi­
cers had their own higher echelon in 
the Pentagon, serving directly under 
the Office of the Secretary of the Air 
Force. Depending on personalities, 
this novel arrangement worked 
reasonably well in some commands, 
not so well in others. The Information 
officers naturally were more pre­
occupied with their primary mission 
of public affairs, and the unit his­
torical functions often became un­
wanted stepchildren. The early Pro­
ject CHECO experience was no ex­
ception. 

T HE CHECO operation initially 
was authorized four historians -

one officer and one civilian with the 
Pacific Air Forces command History 
office in Hawaii, and another officer 
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and civilian with the 2nd Air Division 
in Saigon. These authorizations as­
sumed that the paper trail of USAF 
activities in Vietnam would remain 
relatively constant, that the project 
would initially last two years, and that 
the existing command History organ­
ization would provide the needed su­
pervision and whatever admin­
istrative support the project required. 
These assumptions proved optimistic. 
The workload grew, while support 
came grudgingly. 

Under the original concept, both 
CHECO teams were to focus their 
efforts on researching and writing. In 
addition to gathering documents, the 
team in Saigon was tasked to send 
back monthly progress reports and to 
prepare special studies on USAF op­
erations. The PACAF team was to 
combine the reports from the war zone 
with its own research to prepare an 
inclusive, evaluative report. The 
command Information office further 
tasked the civilian member of the 
Southeast Asia team with the ad­
ditional duty of researching and writ­
ing "comprehensive" semiannual his­
tories of the 2nd Air Division.' This 
additional tasking ran counter to guid­
ance the team had received from 
Washington and brought an added re­
porting channel into play - that of the 
13th Air Force History office, which 
was responsible for monitoring the 
division's periodic reports. Given the 
special dimensions of the project and 
its multiple tasking, the evidence sug­
gests that the number of historians 
assigned to CHECO was modest even 
had the fighting not escalated. 

After meetings in Washington, the 
Southeast Asia team members re­
ported to Saigon in early October 
1962. Few historical projects had 
received more special attention or 
held more promise when the team de­
parted the United States. Even fewer 
perhaps had such an inauspicious be­
ginning after arriving at their des­
tination. Because of their direct chan­
nel to the Air Staff, the historians were 
slow in gaining the confidence of local 
staff members. Their progress was fur­
ther stymied by seemingly insur­
mountable equipment and supply 
problems, which had not received 
adequate attention from higher head­
quarters. Adding to the difficulties, 
the CHECO officer was not a trained 
historian, and the civilian member 
was unprepared for the primitive liv­
ing and working conditions. Two 
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months after their arrival, the CHECO 
officer injured his knee and had to be 
evacuated to the Philippines in Feb­
ruary 1963 for orthopedic surgery. It 
was several months before his 
replacement, also a non-historian, 
was established. Less than a year 
later, the CHECO civilian, Joseph W. 
Grainger, left for a position with the 
Agency for International Develop­
ment. He was captured by the Viet 
Cong in August 1964 and was killed by 
them in January 1965 after he had es­
caped and had been recaptured.• 

Nearly all that came from the early 
CHECO team effort in Vietnam was 
an assorted collection of documents 
and the lesson of how not to go about 
reseaching and writing combat his­
tory. There is a record of uneven 
monthly reports for the team, but no 
histories or studies. Fortunately, the 
usefulness of the initial project was 
salvaged by the CHECO members in 
Hawaii who spent many hours over­
time screening more than 30,000 
documents gathered in Vietnam and 
the harvest from their own research to 
prepare a valuable five-volume nar­
rative of the early USAF combat ex­
perience in Vietnam, with a summary 
and an abstract. The volumes com­
prised over 650 pages of narrative, 
thoroughly documented by more than 
800 footnotes and 450 supporting 
documents. The Hawaii team also 
prepared the delinquent introductory 
2nd Air Division history. The team 
chief and principal author, Lt. Col. 
Donald F. Martin, described the first 
CHECO report as more of a history 
than an "historical evaluation." 
However, considering the pressures 
under which it was prepared, this first 
report is an extraordinary product 
which set a high standard for those 
which followed. Martin was critical of 
the lack of support given to CHECO 
by the traditional History function 
and its foster parent, the Information 
office, both at the higher level and in 
Saigon. To the benefit of today's Air 
Force, Martin's team was able to 
overcome the obstacles that had over­
burdened its counterpart in the war 
zone.' 

There was debate at this juncture as 
to the need for continuing Project 
CHECO. The USAF Historical Divi­
sion and the Directorate of Pians in the 
Air Staff concluded that the special 
coverage it afforded was still de­
sirable, even more so given the in­
creasing intensity of the conflict. The 

five-volume study had proven useful 
to the Air Staff. A new civilian his­
torian, Kenneth Sams, had joined the 
Information function in Saigon in May 
1964 and was making progress on pre­
paring special studies as well as up­
dating the air division's History pro­
gram. Yet, support for CHECO con­
tinued to be minimal. Sams was able 
to obtain the assistance of two enlisted 
historians, but it was nearly a year 
after his arrival before a new CHECO 
officer was on board. Requests for 
TDY assistance through normal His­
tory channels went unfulfilled. 

Given the dissatisfaction with ex­
isting arrangements, Lt. Col. Don 
Martin sought and obtained a new 
charter for CHECO before he left the 
job in Hawaii. In May 1965, CHECO 
was reorganized. The Director of 
Plans became the office of primary 
interest on the Air Staff for CHECO 
matters. The headquarters CHECO 
function was placed under Tactical 
Evaluation, and the office in Saigon 
came under the Directorate of Oper­
ations Analysis. This organizational 
alignment brought CHECO activities 
directly under the control of the 
local Deputy for Plans and Oper­
ations. Both CHECO offices were as­
signed more historians and support 
personnel.• 

UNDER the new charter, the Air 
Staff recognized that Project 

CHECO was not an evaluative ac­
tivity. but rather a specialized histori­
cal function which was distinctly 
different from the normal unit his­
tories. The Air Staffs original per­
ception of CHECO evaluation had 
been partially overtaken by the chang­
ing scope of operations and resultant 
large analysis activities such as the 
tactical evaluation office in Hawaii, 
the combat analysis center in Saigon, 
and the concern at each command 
echelon with the identification of 
problems and their solutions. As Maj. 
Gen. John W. Vogt, Deputy for Plans 
and Operations, Pacific Air Forces, 
explained in his guidance for CHECO 
historians, their "principal responsi­
bility" was "to document significant 
application of Air Force doctrine, 
concepts and policy in specific 
events" as they occurred. Reports 
were to emphasize the historical de­
velopment of the subject and provide 
full and accurate documentation. His­
torical evaluation was to be limited to 
"objective judgments," which could 
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Gen. William W. Momyer shown with Gen. 
Cao Van Vien, Chairman Joint General Staff, 
ARVN, after being awarded the National 
Order of Vietnam ( 5th Class). As Seventh Air 
Force Commander, General Momyer had a 
special interest in Project CHECO and 
CORONA HARVEST evaluations. Upon re­
tirement, he personally took over preparation 
of the final CORONA HARVEST reports. 

be derived as conclusions from the 
documented facts.• 

Given new life, CHECO production 
soared. Guidance on study topics 
came directly from the Air Staff, while 
other topics were developed by the 
CHECO teams. Most of the re­
searching and writing of studies was 
centered in Southeast Asia. Although 
the Hawaii office prepared some stud­
ies, it primarily edited, published, and 
distributed those prepared in the field. 
In Saigon, Sams personally completed 
five studies for publication over the 
next year, beginning with a classic top 
secret report entitled, Escalation of 
the War, July-December /964. 

From May 1965 until the Tet offens­
ive at the beginning of 1968, more than 
50 CHECO reports were published 
and distributed throughout the Air 
Force. These classified reports ranged 
in scope from small operational stud­
ies, such as The Siege at Plei Me, to 
comprehensive topical histories, like 
Control of Air Strikes in SEA, 
/961-1966. Assistance other than the 
assignment of new historians was 
readily available under the more dy­
namic relationship with Operations. 
Rated officers, such as Capt. Gary D. 
Sheets, who had completed their fly­
ing assignments early, joined CHECO 
to write reports in their areas of exper­
tise. In the summer of I 966, two Air 
Force Academy officers served with 
the project on temporary duty to pro­
duce special reports, opening the 
window for much wider Academy par­
ticipation in the years ahead. The 
CHECO office in Hawaii also pro­
vided TDY assistance and in I 968 add­
ed a new dimension to the project 
when Col. Edward C. Burtenshaw, the 
second chief of CHECO, and two 
other officers prepared a special re­
port on The Pueblo Incident in Korea. 
setting the stage for expanding the 
CHECO concept worldwide. '0 

One of the more innovative con­
cepts for augmenting CHECO profes­
sional activities in Southeast Asia was 
the Air Force Academy Summer Re­
search Program. Col. Alfred F. 
Hurley, head of the Academy's His-
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tory Department, and Col. Jesse C. 
Gatlin, head of the English Depart­
ment, led a group of Academy profes­
sors to Southeast Asia for the summer 
of I 968 to produce eight studies of 
exceptional quality. Colonel Hurley 
wrote a study entitled The EC-47 in 
Southeast Asia. and Colonel Gatlin 
wrote about the Igloo White sur-. 
veillance systems. The list of CHECO 
studies prepared by Academy officers 
is impressive. In the course of the war, 
a total of33 professors joined CHECO 
on temporary duty to augment the 
study effort. Others, like Lt. Col. John 
Schlight and Maj. Phillip Caine, spent 
full 12-month tours, producing more 
than one study apiece. The full-time 
Academy officers provided a ready 
source of management expertise when 
Ken Sams retired in 1971 after many 
years of service as an Air Force his­
torian, the last six of which were spent 
with Project CHECO documenting 

the USAF role in Southeast Asia. 
When the war ended, the CHECO 
effort had left a legacy of 218 special 
studies, 14 of which Ken Sams had 
either personally authored or co­
authored.'' 

When Project CHECO moved 
under the protective wing of Oper­
ations in 1965, it was not immediately 
disassociated from the traditional 
History function in Vietnam. With 
full consent of the Information office 
at 2nd Air Division (redesignated 7th 
Air Force on 1 April 1%6), Project 
CHECO retained the unit history re­
sponsibility for almost two more 
years. Afterward, to avoid dupli­
cation, it was mutually agreed that 
CHECO would be responsible for the 
operations history and the History of­
fice would cover support activities. 

The historical function's relation­
ship with information was objected to 
by historians who were acquainted 
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with the neglect of the traditional His­
tory responsibilities in Southeast 
Asia. Colonel Burtenshaw, the chief 
of CHECO, suggested that Pacific Air 
Forces take the initiative and estab­
lish an historical program reporting 
directly to the Chief of Staff and estab-
1 is h a separate channel of com­
munication at base and numbered Air 
Force to place the historian close to 
the commander. His suggestion was 
not acted upon, but a report by Max 
Rosenberg, head of the historical liai­
son office in Washington, 12 did help 
precipitate critical review of the His­
tory program by a Blue Ribbon com­
mittee beginning in 1968. This com­
mittee influenced a radical change in 
the way the Air Force managed its 
historical resources. 

In 1969, the Secretary of the Air 
Force approved a proposal to cen­
tralize control of the History program 
under a general officer at the Air Staff 
level. To oversee the activities of the 
program, he established the USAF 
Historical Advisory Committee, first 
chaired by Dr. I. B. Holley, professor 
of History at Duke University and an 
Air Force Reserve officer. The Office 
of Air Force History was organized, 
and Maj. Gen. R. A. Grussendorf was 
brought back to active duty as the first 
chief. At the Air University, the 
USAF Historical Division became the 
Albert F. Simpson Historical Re­
search Center (changed in 1984 to the 
USAF Historical Research Center), 
and its mission was changed primarily 
to serve as the repository for Air Force 
histories and to serve worldwide re­
search needs. At major command and 
below, the History offices were re­
aligned to make them directly re­
sponsive to their commanders. In May 
1970, the Office of Air Force History 
became the Air Staff focal point for 
Project CHECO. The project retained 
its relationship with Operations in the 
Pacific Air Forces until its work in 
Southeast Asia was completed. The 
Office of Air Force History insti­
tutionalized the project with the 
command History functions in Europe 
and the Pacific, and the Historical 
Research Center maintained a micro­
film team ready for worldwide de­
ployment. Thus, Project CHECO had 
come full circle. Along the way, it had 
played an active role in increasing 
historical awareness in the Air Force 
and had helped bring about what many 
saw as a renaissance within Air Force 
history. 13 
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PROJECT CORONA HARVEST, 
which was conceived in 1966 to 

undertake the inclusive evaluation of 
airpower in Southeast Asia, was even 
more dynamic in elevating historical 
awareness within the Air Force. Al­
though it was often identified with 
CHECO and the two were mutually 
supportive, CORONA HARVEST 
was distinct in its objectives, detail of 
documentation, management, and 
utility. Where CHECO provided 
timely coverage direct from the the­
ater of operations, CORONA HAR­
VEST reached into every depth of Air 
Force involvement to document the 
total air effort, to retrieve the lessons 

... CORONA HAR-
VEST reached into every 
depth of Air Force in­
volvement to document 
the total air effort, to re­
trieve the lessons learned, 
and to examine the valid~ 
ity of USAF and joint con­
cepts and doctrine. 

learned, and to examine the validity of 
USAF and joint concepts and doc­
trine. Unlike CHECO's early insti­
tutional throes, CORONA HAR­
VEST was born with a full measure of 
muscle and marrow. An Air Staff 
steering committee, chaired by the 
Vice Chief of Staff, provided broad 
policy guidance and made certain that 
support from all echelons was forth­
coming. Corporate management, re­
plete with healthy manning and tech­
nological support, was installed 
within the Aerospace Studies Institute 
at the Air University. Student and 
faculty resources were available to 
support the evaluation, and each ma­
jor command and separate operating 
agency designated a project office to 
insure inclusive participation. The 
project got off to a false start when 
officials gave it the unseemly nick­
name LOYAL LOOK, but quickly 
grasping the parochial implications 
changed it to the more euphemistic 
title, CORONA HARVEST. 14 

CORONA HARVEST was given 
command emphasis at every level and 
was directly supported by the USAF 
Historical Program. In tfie major 

commands, the project officers 
worked hand-in-glove with the his­
torians to prepare study inputs to 
CORONA HARVEST and to insure 
the integrated submission of docu­
ments. At the Air University, senior 
historian Frank Futrell worked di­
rectly with the project, while engaged 
in researching and writing the official 
history of the Air Force in Southeast 
Asia through 1965." The Historical 
Division served as the central reposi­
tory for Air Force documentation re­
lating to the war. It assisted with set­
ting up a microfilm capability and 
helped CORONA HARVEST estab­
lish an oral history program in 1968 to 
collect information that was not avail­
able by other means. tORONA 
HAR VEST also relied on end-of-tour 
reports by key personnel returned 
from the war to fill gaps in research. 

When the CORONA HARVEST of­
fice at the Air University began phas­
ing out in the early 1970s, the Histori­
cal Research Center inherited its 
documentation system, including the 
oral history program, the end-of-tour 
reports, and the microfilming capa­
bility. Thus, CORONA HARVEST 
not only helped rekindle historical­
mindedness within the Air Force, but 
made a substantial contribution 
toward modernizing the History pro­
gram's research capabilities. 1

• 

Project CHECO and the Pacific Air 
Force headquarters staff shared a 
special relationship with CORONA 
HARVEST. A fully manned COR­
ONA HARVEST study group was set 
up at Hickam, first under Tactical 
Evaluation and then under Operations 
Analysis, to fulfill the command's re­
sponsibilities in support of the evalu­
ation. This study group completed a 
series of key evaluative studies in 
various airpower activities. It also 
identified, reviewed, and collected 
thousands of pertinent documents. In 
Southeast Asia, Project CHECO be­
came the CORONA HARVEST agent 
for document collection in 1968 and 
began recording in microfilm per­
tinent documents at Air Force head­
quarters in Vietnam, Thailand, and 
the Philippines. The CHECO histori­
ans had begun a limited microfilming 
operation earlier, but this was 
expanded to include a team of five 
technicians who were dedicated full­
time to the document collection mis­
sion. The versatility of this effort was 
demonstrated in 1969 when team 
members deployed to 5th Air Force 
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headquarters to microfilm records re­
lating to the shooting down of a USAF 
EC-121 by the North Koreans. From 
1968 through the end of the conflict, 
the team microfilmed a wealth of 
valuable documents but, un­
fortunately, because of the conditions 
under which it was shot, much of this 
film proved of uneven quality when it 
was developed later at the Historical 
Research Center. '7 

As the war wound down to its un­
happy conclusion, officials involved 
with CORONA HARVEST were 
acutely aware that the project would 
not realize its primary objective of 
"evaluating the overall effectiveness 
of airpower in Southeast Asia." Un­
like the conditions which prevailed 
for the United States Strategic Bomb­
ing Survey following World War II, 
the failure to pursue a winning 
national policy in Southeast Asia had 

· precluded any inclusive evaluation of 
military results. Conclusive quan­
titative data simply was not available. 
This potential difficulty was pre­
sumed by the CORONA HARVEST 
group when it published the overall 
plan for the project in June 1967. The 
qualification was made that the pro­
ject's final assessment would "not be 
confirmed until access to enemy in­
formation is obtained after the conflict 
is over." Such an overall assessment 
was further inhibited by the lack of 
effective evaluative data flowing 
through the operations reporting sys­
tem, which comprised mostly im­
mediate operational data such as 
sortie rates, bomb tonnages exploded, 
bomb damage assessments, secondary 
explosions,'" and body counts. On the 
positive side, Project CORONA 
HARVEST was eminently successful 
in completing its other objectives of 
documenting the Air Force's role in 
the war and of identifying and defining 
the operational, conceptual, and doc­
trinal lessons learned. In this regard, 
the project collected valuable data 
and prepared studies that would be 
necessary to any long-range as­
sessment of the Air Force's role as an 
instrument of national policy in 
Southeast Asia. 

The Air University office com­
pleted the final CORONA HARVEST 
report for the period, 1954-1969, com­
prising 11 volumes, and the Pacific 
Air Forces study group prepared 16 
volumes for the remaining period of 
the war. Timely completion of these 
reports and the executive summaries 
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permitted the closing of these two pro­
ject offices in 1975 and 1976. In April 
1974, a new dimension was added to 
the project when Gen. William W. 
Momyer, USAF (Ret.), was hired as 
the Consultant to the Vice Chief of 
Staff, USAF, for CORONA HAR­
VEST matters. 19 General Momyer be­
gan sifting through the mass of infor­
mation in the final reports to identify · 
the relevant lessons for consideration 
by Air Force commanders. No one 
had better credentials for addressing 
tactical concepts and doctrine. Years 
on the Air Staff and in tactical com­
mand positions (as Commander of 7th 
Air Force during the critical years, 
1966-1968, and then as Commander of 
Tactical Air Command until his re-
. tirement in 1973) made the General 
uniquely qualified to speak for air­
power in Southeast Asia. After re­
viewing the CORONA HARVEST 
final reports, General Momyer pre­
pared 21 reports containing his com­
ments and recommendations. These 
became known as the '' Momyer re­
ports" and were referred by the Vice 
Chief to the Air Staff and relevant 
commands for comment and action as 
appropriate. 20 Staffing of the Momyer 
reports was completed in 1976. They 
focused on doctrinal and functional 
lessons and were designed for internal 
utility, with suggestions for improv­
ing operations and enhancing the fu­
ture force. 

Although both CHECO and COR­
ONA HARVEST earned high marks 
for their immediate utility to Air 
Force planners and operators, the 
concern now is for the more lasting 
promise their legacy holds for histori­
ans whose field of study embraces air 
warfare in Southeast Asia. As guard­
ian of the CHECO and CORON A 
HARVEST collections, the USAF 
Historical Research Center holds the 
keys to the substantial documentation 
derived from the two projects. Thus 
far, access to many of the documents 
within the two collections has been 
restricted because of their security 
classifications. Primary users have 
included Air War College students, 
who published a series of unclassified 
monographs on Air Force operations 
in Southeast Asia. 21 General Momyer 
relied on the documents to write por­
tions of his book, Air Power in Three 
Wars, which was published in 1978. 22 

Perhaps the largest beneficiary has 
been the Office of Air Force History, 
which has been dependent upon the 

document collections to support the 
bulk of research for its official his­
tories of the war. To date, the Office 
has published five special studies and 
four major volumes on the Air Force's 
history in Southeast Asia. Another six 
volumes are in various stages of 
production. 23 

Upon completion of CORONA 
HARVEST, senior USAF officials 
were sensitive to the need for ob­
taining the widest possible dissemi­
nation of information concerning the 
Air Force's role in Southeast Asia. 
The Vice Chief of Staff directed that a 
concerted effort be made to down­
grade CORONA HARVEST material 
on the war for the purpose of reaching 
a wide audience. A sensitivity review 
panel was formed under General Mo­
myer and was given classification 
downgrading authority to carry out the 
process. This panel acted to insure 
that the CORONA HARVEST reports 
were downgraded to the lowest classi­
fication "consistent with current se­
curity policy." A number of docu­
ments were declassified. 24 Since that 
date, the primary responsibility for 
downgrading documents of the Viet­
nam era has rested with the originating 
authority. This means that the primary 
downgrading authority for the 
CHECO reports and a sizeable num­
ber of documents in the CORONA 
HARVEST collection is vested in the 
Pacific Air Force headquarters as the 
originating command, rather than in 
the USAF Historical Research Center 
as the keeper of the collections. The 
Office of Air Force History has ob­
tained limited authority to downgrade 
soine CHECO reports on an indi­
vidual basis. The Center was given 
limited downgrading responsibilities 
under Project SAFE PAPER in 1972, 
but as presently constituted, this does 
not extend to documents that origin­
ated in the past 30 years which are 
exempt from automatic downgrading. 
SAFE PAPER brings documents of 
the Korean conflict under blanket re­
view, but not those for Southeast 
Asia. According to Center Director. 
Lloyd H. Cornett, Jr., 22 of the 218 
CHECO reports are presently un­
classified. Efforts are underway to 
have additional reports reviewed for 
downgrading." For scholars who wish 
to reseach the collections, historical 
researcher access to the classified 
documents is controlled by the Air 
Force Office of Public Affairs -
Magazines and Books (AFOPA-MB). 
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Scholars seeking access should write 
to AFOPA-MB, 1221 South Fern St., 
Room D159, Arlington, VA 22202. Be­
fore being granted access, scholars 
must obtain a researcher's agreement 
to safeguard classified information 
and submit notes and manuscripts for 
security review. 2• 

I N conclusion, the Southeast Asia 
conflict was the most well­

documented of American wars, and 
Projects CHECO and CORONA 
HARVEST joined with the USAF 
Historical Program to preserve the Air 
Force's share of that documentation. 
Although CHECO and CORONA 
HARVEST provided the Air Force 
with timely and lasting corporate in­
sights into operational, conceptual, 
and doctrinal lessons from the war, 
their own unique accomplishments 
are an encouragement to the larger 
family of official historians. Both pro­
jects were born of an explicit need for 
their services. Both were dedicated to 
mission, utility, and scholarly 
achievement. Both were innovative in 
the use of new methods and new tech­
nology. Both were essentially an ad­
junct to the classic official histories, 
but also served as a catalyst for help­
ing revitalize the Air Force's official 
History program. Their substantial 
contribution to greater historical­
mindedness within the Air Force is a 
tribute to the exceptionally high level 
of meaningful production achieved by 
both. They did not write history for 
history's sake. They did not collect 
documents for the shelf. Any histori­
cal analysis of their achievements 
must question whether or not there 
would have been a CHECO program 
as we know it had Lt. Col. Don Martin 
not made such an extraordinary first 
effort and had he not produced such a 
useful pilot historical study. After all, 
it is by their deeds that we shall know 
them. Their legacy is one of pro­
duction and utility. Nothing less, 
nothing more. 

NOTES 
I. Gen. William W. Momyer, "Obser­

vations of the Vietnamese War, July 
1966-July 1968," CORONA HARVEST 
paper, Nqv. 1970, USAFHRC K740.131. 

2. Msg, PFCVC 108, HQ Pacific Air 
Forces to HQ USAF, Subj.: USAF His­
tory of Operations in S.E.A., Z Mar. {%!; 
Ltr., Col. W. J. Meng, ex to the Vice Chief 
of Staff, HQ USAF, to PACAF (PFCVC), 
Subj.: Current Historical Evaluation of 
Counterinsurgency Operations, 30 June 
1962. 

3. Ltr., Lt. Gen. Thomas S. Moorman, 

120 

Vice C-in-C, PACAF, to Maj. Gen. Seth J. 
McKee, Dir. of Plans, HQ USAF, Subj.: 
Expanded Terms of Reference for Project 
CHECO, May 1965; Ltr., Lt. Gen. K. K. 
Compton, Dep. CS Plans, HQ USAF, to 
Maj. Gen. John W. Vogt, DCS Plans and 
Ops, HQ PACAF, Subj.: CHECO Terms 
of Reference, 16 Apr. 1966; Revised Terms 
of Reference for Project CHECO, 30 Aug. 
1969. 

4. Robert F. Futrell, The United States 
Air Force in Korea, 1950-1953. (New 
York, 1961). 

5. Msg, PACAF Hickam AFB, Hawaii, 
to 13 AF, Clark AB, the Philippines, 
Subj.: Current Historical Evaluation of 
Counterinsurgency Operations, 060 I 12Z 
Oct. 1962. 

6. CHECO Team Progress Reports, Oct. 
1962-Dec. 1963; USAF Historical News 
Letter, Air University, Aug. 1965. 

7. Ltr., Lt. Col. Donald F. Martin to Mr. 
Joseph W. Angell, Jr., HQ USAF/CHO, 10 
July 1964; CHECO Journal by Lt. Col. 
Donald F. Martin, July 1963 to July 1964. 

8. Msg, P ACAF Vice Chief of Staff to 
CSAF, Subj.: Current Historical Evalu­
ation of Counterinsurgency Operations, 16 
Oct. 1964; Ltr., Max Rosenberg, Acting 
Chief, USAF Historical Division Liaison 
Office to HQ USAF (AFXPDR), Subj.: 
CHECO, 24 Nov. 1964; Ltr., Mr. Kenneth 
Sams, CHECO Team Chief, SEA, to 2nd 
Air Division Commander, Subj.: 
Expanded CHECO Program, I June 1965. 

9. Ltr., Maj. Gen. John W. Vogt, DCS 
Plans and Operations, HQ PACAF, to 
Maj. Gen. Gilbert L. Meyers, Dep. 
Comdr, 2nd Air Division, Subj.: CHECO 
Guidance, 11 Jan. 1966. 

10. Edward T. Russell, Research Guide 
to the Published Project CHECO Reports, 
1964-1976, Air University, Aug. 1977. 

11. Ibid.; List of SEA CHECO Person­
nel, 1962-1970; Ltr., Col. Carl A. An­
derson, Dir. of Tac Analysis to 7AFIDOE, 
Subj.: Manpower Change Request, 2 Feb. 
1971. 

12. Ltr., Col. Edward C. Burtenshaw, 
Chief CHECO Division, HQ PACAF to 
Mr. Max Rosenberg, Chief, USAF His­
torical Research Division Liaison Office, 
21 Nov. 1967; Trip Report, Max Rosen­
berg, Chief Liaison Office to Chief USAF 
Historical Division, 22 May 1967. 

13. Ltr., Maj. Gen. R. A. Grussendorf, 
Chief, Office of Air Force History, to 
Brig. Gen. Charles L. Bennett, Jr., Chief 
of Staff, Seventh Air Force, Subj.: Project 
CHECO, 4 June 1970. 

14. Ltr., Gen. Bruce K. Holloway, Vice 
Chief of Staff, HQ USAF, to Air Force 
Major Commands, Subj.; Evaluation of 
Effectiveness of Airpower in SEA, 23 
Nov. 1966; Ltr., Col. W. P. Gordon, Jr., 
Chief, Project LOYAL LOOK, to AUL 
and ASHAF, Subj.: Project LOYAL 
LOOK, 16 Jan. 1967. 

15. Ltr., Albert F. Simpson, Chief, 
USAF Historical Division, Subj.: Chron­
ology for CORONA HARVEST, 6 Sept. 
196?; Robert F. FcttreU, Tire Urrited States 
Air Force in Southeast Asia, The Advisory 
Years to 1965 (Washington, D.C., 1981). 

16. CORONA HARVEST News Letter, 
Aerospace Studies Institute, Aug. 1968; 
Ltr., Lt. Gen. Alvan C. Gillem, II, Com­
mander, Air University to AF/CVC, Subj.: 

CORONA HARVEST Documentation 
Programs, 13 Aug. 1970. 

17. Ltr., Lt. Gen. John D. Lavelle, Vice 
CINCPACAF, to HQ USAF (AFCVC), 
Subj.: Project CORONA HARVEST, 26 
Jan. 1971; Ltr., Brig. Gen. Franklin A. 
Nichols, Chief of Staff, 7AF, to all 7AF 
Units, Subj.: CORONA HARVEST, 19 
Sept. 1967. 

18. End of Mission Report, Col. Robert 
L. Gleason, Chief, CORONA HARVEST 
Project Office, Maxwell AFB, AL, July 
1973. 

19. Information Paper on Admin­
istration/Management of Project COR­
ONA HARVEST, undated. 

20. Background paper on Project COR­
ONA HARVEST and General William W. 
Momyer, by Maj. A. J. C. Lavalle, 
AF/XODL, 23 Sept. 1975. 

21. USAF Southeast Asia Monograph 
Series, Monographs 1-9, Air War College, 
1976-1979. 

22. Gen. William W. Momyer, Air 
Power in Three Wars (Air University, 
1978). 

23. Long-Range Book Publication Plan 
(Washington, D.C.: Office of Air Force 
History, I 985). 

24. Ltr., Gen. R.H. Ellis, Vice Chief of 
Staff to HQ USAF Sensitivity Review 
Panel (General Momyer, Chairman), 
Subj.: CORONA HARVEST - Classi­
fication Downgrading, 17 June 1975. 

25. Interview, author with Dr. Richard 
E. Morse, Chief, Reference Division, 
USAF Historical Research Center, 30 
Apr. 1985. 

26. DOD 5200. J-R/ AFR 205-1, Infor­
mation Security Program Regulation, 7 
Dec. 1982. 

Warren A. Trest is the senior 
historian at the USAF Historical Re­
search Center, Maxwell AFB, AL, 
and is a Korean War veteran. During 
the Southeast Asia conflict, he 
served as a civilian historian with 
Project CHECO In Vietnam and at 
Headquarters Pacific Air Forces. He 
helped establish the PACAF 
CORONA HARVEST office and 
wrote several reports for {he pro­
ject. He has written numerous offi­
cial histories and monographs 
while serving with the USAF His­
torical Program as command histo­
rian with the United State Air Forces 
in Europe and the Air Training 
Command. His last assignment was 
as Chief of the Histories Division 
with the office of Air Force History. 

AEROSPACE HISTORIAN 




